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SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS
July 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025

ASPHALT - Hot Mix Lay Concrete - Type A

Evans &
Associates
Construction Co
Cummins INC
Per Ton - Delivered no bid ) 97.00
Per Ton - Delivered & Laid no bid $ 103.00
Per Ton - Pick Up S 98.00 ] S 87.00
ASPHALT - Hot Mix Lay Concrete - Type B
Evans &
Associates
Construction Co
Cummins iNC
Per Ton - Delivered no bid 5 97.00
Per Ton - Delivered & Laid no bid $ 103.00
Per Ton - Pick Up S 106.50 | S 87.00
ASPHALT - Hot Mix Lay Concrete - Type C
Evans &
Associates
Construction Co
Cummins INC
Per Ton - Delivered no bid S 97.00
Per Ton - Delivered & Laid no bid 5 103.00
Per Ton - Pick Up S 109.85 | § 87.00
MILLINGS
Evans &
Associates
Construction Co
Cummins INC
Asphalt Millings no bid no bid
Crushed Millings no bid 5 30.00 | perton
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SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS

July 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025

PROLINE POLYMER MOD COLD ASPHALT

Per Ton Logan Co Asphalt
FOB Plant S 126.50
Delivered ) 159.00
Delivered & Laid NO BIb
Minimum 25 tons DELWERED

Logan Co Asphalt

354t Bags - Delivered NO BID
354 Bags - Delivered & Laid NO BIb
35# - FOB Plant NO BID
Minimun NO BID

Logan Co Asphialt

50# Bags - Delivered ) 14.50
50# Bags - Delivered & Laid no bid
50# Bags - FOB Plant S 12.50

Minimum

50 BAGS DELIVERED

MASTIC CRACK SEALANT

Logan Co Asphalt

Per ib. no bid
FLY ASH - OILS
Coastal Energy Evans & Associates
Per Ton
Fly Ash Aggregates - Delivered no bid no bid
Fly Ash Aggregates - Pickup no bid no bid
Per Gallon
AC7.5 no bid no bid
AC 20 no hid no bid
MC 30 S 2.75 no bid
MC 70 S 2.72 no bid
MC 800 s 2.47 no bid
MC 3000 5 2.42 no bid
S5-1 Tack Gil S 24218 6.00

Pickup or Delivery

Not Provided
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SIX MIONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS
haly 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025

EMULSION PRODUCTS

per Gallon Coastal Energy *Vance Bros Ergon  [Wright AsphaltProducts (
Plant Location;
PO Box 218 Willow 4908 N Bryant OKC, 5850 ?{;amas
Springs MO 65793 OK73121 Catonsa, OK
74015
FADOWLAKEBATTLEFIELD

SS-1 PICKUP no bid 5 23515 2.30 [NOBID
SS-1 DELIVERED S 24215 2461 S 2.35 |no bid
CRS-2 PICKUP no hid S 22515 1.90 1.79
CRS-2 DELIVERED S 19215 23615 1.95 1.82
CRS-2S PICKUP no bid S 26515 2.29 2.2
CRS-25 DELIVERED S 22115 2768 2.34 2.23
CRS-2+ PICKUP no bid $ 250 S 2.13 2.08
CRS-2+ DELIVERED S 1.97 | § 28618 2.18 2.1
AE-P PICKUP no bid - S 27515 2.45 |no bid
AE-P DELIVERED S 24718 2.861 8§ 2.50 [no bid
CQS-1F PICKUP , no hid no bid S 2.10 2.19
CQS-1F DELIVERED g 2.16 no bid S 2.15 2.21
REJUVENATOR

Coastal Energy 1 Vance Bros [ Ergon  {Wright Asphalt Product
CMS - 1PC SCRUB SEAL NOT NOTED not noted
SEALER APPLIED IN PLACE not noted NOT NOTED no hid not noted
MAXIMUM WAIT TIME no bid NG BID 24 hrs  |no bid
DEMURRAGE CHARGE: (2HRFREE) perhr | § 100.00 14 S 10000 S 100.00 $75.00
PUMP OFF CHARGE 5 125.001 5 125.00}{ S 150.00 $100.00
SHORT FREIGHT S 1,550.00 -- -
LOAD MINUMUM 5,500.00 gallons 5,500 galions 48,000ths

*Copastal Energy Corp- Short Freight Fee
$1,550.00 for loads less than 5,500 gals

* Ergon- additonal freight added to
loads less than 5700 gallons
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SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS
July 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025

* Vance Brothers LLC $125 if requested
demurrage charge:

Page 4 of 16



pig ou 1004 Jad 8 X ,v/¢
‘ ) pig ou 1004 Jad .8 X ,8/S
a1es Joud 03 102[gns 2J2 SWI} ¥201s U] pig ou 1003 4ad 8% .8/
‘0yYy Aep T sdiys 59035 Ul Ajjedausn

$Z-05-90 YSN0aU3 piteA 30lid pIg ou 1004 12d 8 X ,Z/T
wawdiys 4ad 1594 04 J19RI0 WINWIUNA pIg cu 10ct48d 9% /T

paieadl 1eaH _ uogien
07 ‘edony dinb3 @ sued JEIM 14 Jad / soud palond
B VTS 85°L1S piq ou pig cu 0582 S {szoz ) 3004 4ad B X, b/E
187075 TO'STS pig ou 7LT S| S6TZ S 168691 S 1004 43¢ g X 8/
ZTSTS £6'0TS pigou 20T S 12691 S| TTLT S 1004 43d ;5 X ,8/S
69'91S 66'TTS pig ou plq ou pig cu piq ou 100440d 8% ,Z/T
TT'ZTS 95'8S pIg cu plg ou pIq ou 0407 ) joc44ed 9 X ,Z/T

pa1edl] 189H uogseD paiead] 183H uoagJed palead| 1e5H uogsed
18D UBLIEM AYINIHOVYIA ISNOHMOTI3A JNI 0D SSOd and 14 Jad / a31ud paiony

S3AVY19 Y3aAVHD

a81ey2.ns (an4 0087 S 371N Q3QV0T ¥3d LHDITYS
NOBS Z/T + WY SSBID | 6£°29T S - 00°88T S MOVS S'9 ATYV3 HIH
{6007) ¥V ssepd SL9YPT S - 00"¥8T S NIYS 9 1S d #000¥%
(00T} v SSBD SLTYT S - 0087 S MOVS S I'S'd #00S€
- SLZHT S - 00'08T S MOVS S 1I°S'd #000€

321 WUN 12301 2214 HUN
N “0D FLIYINOD QINZ« _ "00 'SOYE 353700 1onaoyd

313¥INOD

c707 ‘TE Jaqwa03Q 015207 ‘T AINT
SNOILYINEGYL ald STVIEILYIA HINOW XIS




piq ou pig ou pig ou 1004 43d £ X 8% ,8/9
piq ou piq ou pig ou 1004 42d 9 X 8 X 8/
pig ou pig ou pigou
pig ou pig ou pig ou 100443d X ,9X,8/S
piq ou piq ou pig ou 100448d £ X,9X,8/¢
piq ou piq ou pig ou joopied 9% ,.9x%,8/S
piq ou pig ou pig ou
pig ou pig ou pig ou 100443¢ 8% ,8X,T/T
pig ou pig cu pig cu 1004430 X ,8%,Z/T
pig ou pig cu pIg cu 1W004dad 99X, 8X,Z/T
pig ou pig ou pIq ou j0044ad 8% ,9%,Z/T
pig ou piq ou pig ou 100} 430 LX ,9X,Z/T
piq ou pig ou pig ou 100449d 9% ,9X,Z/T
oS ZHA uogJed YsiH
3]0H 10¢ :
18D UBLIBAA yo0} Jad s1921ad palony
9T 40 G 93ed

$Z0Z ‘IE Jaquiadaq 03 70T ‘T AT
SNOILVINEYL GI9 STYIYILYIA HINOW XIS




SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS

July 1, 2025 to Pecember 31, 2025

ROCK
DOLESE BROS. CO. I Stewart Stone l Burbank Materiais
FOB FOB Pickup | FOB Per tan
Enid SY 7 Mile Mine Pawnee Pickup - Burbank

11/2" Crusher Run 3§ 3206165 12,2516 14.50 no hid 5 12.00
3/4" Crusher Run no bid na bid no bid no bid ) 12.00
Screenings 3 31211 8 115011 S 9.25 no bid s 10,00
3/8" Chips S 42.38 no bid no bid no bid 5 15.50
142" Chips no bid NO BID 5 19.00 no bid 3 15.50
5/8" Chips S 42.14 NO 8iD no bid no hid S 15.50
11/2" Road Rock S 33.86 no bid no bid no hid S 15.50
3/A" Class A no hid no bid no hid no bid S 15.50
Rip Rap doesn't meet ODOT Freeze Thaw
12" Rip Rap NO 81D S 26,50} % 27.00 no hid no bid
18" Rip Rap NO BiD S 2650 ] § 25.00 ne bid 5 29.00
TBSC Type E S 33.86 ne bid no hid no bid no bid
3/4" TBSC no bid no hid no bid no bid no bid
Bedding Rock no bid no bid no bid no hid 5 18.00
Crushed Concrete no bid no bid no hid no bid ne bid
Screenings-Asphalt no hid no bid no bid no bid no bid
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SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS
July 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025

ROCK
DOLESE BROS. CO.
FOB FOB
Enid SY 7 Mile Mine
11/2" Crusher Run 5 32,06 S 12.25
3/4" Crusher Run no bid no bid
Screenings $ 31,21 $ 11.50
3/8" Chips S 42.38 no hid
1/2" Chips no hid NO BID
5/8" Chips S 42.14 NO 81D
11/2" Road Rock 5 33.86 no hid
3/4" Class A no bid no bid
Rip Rap doesn't meet ODOT Freeze Thaw
12" Rip Rap NOBID |5 26.50
18" Rip Rap NOBID |$ 26.50
TBSC Type E 5 33.86 no bid
3/4" TBSC no bid no bid
Bedding Rock no bid no bid
Crushed Concrete no hid na bid
Screenings-Asphalt no bid no bid
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SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS
July 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025

BRIDGE NAILS
Rail Road Yard Sunbelt
40 D Common, Per 100# no hid no bid
60 D Common, Per 100i# no bid no bid
80 D Commaon, Per 100# no hid no hid
40 D Ring Shank, Per 100# no bid no bid
60 D Ring Shank, Per 1604 no bid no hid
CLIPS
Rail Road Yard Sunhelt

Steel "I" Beam Bridge Clips-Lg - each no bid no bid
Steel "I" Beam Bridge Clips-Sm - each no hid no bid
BEAMS

' | Rail Road Yard Sunbelt
HP 8 x 36 # Beams - NEW {no welds, rust free) S 0.7866 50.79
Length 20'-60' 30-40-50
HP 10 x 42" Beams-NEW (no welds, rust free} S - 0.7866 0.779
Length 20°-60' 30-40-50
STRUCTURAL STEEL-NEW

| Rail Road Yard Sunbelt
Per # foot S 0.8900 0.784
Length Standard 20 NOT NOTED
STRUCTURAL STEEL-USED
| Rail Road Yard Sunbelt

Per # foot S 0.45 [NO BID
Length RANDOM NA

Railroad Yard( Stillwater)- 20' and 40' for channel, flat, and angle.

5 ft increments 4AWF Beams
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SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS
July 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025

REBAR .

| Rail Road Yard Sunbelt
1/2"- per ft. - rust free S 0.35 50.35
Length: Standard 20'- 40 20
1/2"- per ft. - rust free S 0.560 $0.58
Length: Non Standard - (foot) CTL- RANDOM not noted
5/8" - per ft. - rust free ) 0.55 50.56
Length: Standard - (foot) 20'&40' 20
5/8" - per ft. - rust free S 0.870 $0.89
Length: Non Standard - {foot) CTL- RANDOM not noted
GUARDRAILS

l Rail Road Yard Sunbelt Advance Workzone Services LLC
NEW - per ft. S 9.38 $8.85 534.00
USED - per ft. S 3.50 $4.25 no bid
ENDWINGS .

Rail Road Yard Sunbelt Advance Workzone Services LLC

NEW - per ft, 3 63.00 $64.40 no bid
USED - per ft. NO BiD no hid no hid
CHAIRS

l Rail Road Yard Sunbelt Advance Workzone Services LLC
Continous - each no bid $6.80 no bid
Single - Each no bid $1.85 no bid
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SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS
July 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025

SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID
July 1, 2022 to December 31, 2022

BRIDGE PLANKS

| Rail Road Yard
GALVANIZED 6 X 2, PER SQ FT
7 GUAGE $ 24.64
10 GUAGE S 16.52
12 GUAGE S 13.37
GALVANIZED 9X3 PER SQ FT
3 GUAGE S 37.24
5 GUAGE S 33.13
7 GUAGE S 30.15
GALVANIZED 12X4 1/4PER SQ FT
7 GUAGE no bid
BLACKK 6X2 PERSQ FT
7 GUAGE S 18.76
10 GUAGE S 14.63
12 GUAGE S 11.80
BLACK 12X4 1/4 PER SQ FT
7 GUAGE no bid
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SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS
July 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025

PIPE PILING

Rail Road Yard Sunbelt
7'5/8 X 394, 1/2" wall, per foot no bid no bid
9'5/8 X 47#, 1/2" wall, perfoot | $ 4278 no bid
HEAVY WALL PILING

Rail Road Yard l i *Gateway Steel Sunbelt
6" - NEW - per ft no bid 14.00 $26.00
7% - NEW - per ft no bid no bid no bid
8" - NEW- per ft no bid 20.22 ne bid
9" - NEW - per ft no bid 26.00 no hid
10" - NEW-per ft no bid $29.00 $33.00
12" - NEW - per ft no bid 34.00 no hid
6" - USED - per ft no bid 11.50 no bid
7" - USED - per ft S 24.15 no bid no bid
8"-USED - per fi S 26.22 19.00 no bid
9" - USED per ft S 23.79 no bid no bid
10" - USED - per ft S 31.74 27.00 no hid
12" - USED - per ft no bid 32.00 no bid
* GATEWAY STEEL: Prices are "Fuil Load" and "Delivered" FOB Grant County, OK
INTERLOCKING SHEET PILING

Rail Road Yard Gateway Steel Sunbelt
7 Gauge - Aluminized no bid no bid no bid
7 Gauge - Galvanized ) 13.72 no bid no bid
7 Gauge - Black $ 10.13 no bid no bid
10 Gauge - Aluminized no bid no hid na bid
10 Gauge - Galvanized S 8.86 no bid $8.85
10 Gauge - Black s 7.64 no bid $7.95
12 Gauge -Aluminized no hid no hid no bid
12 Gauge - Galvanized S 7.22 no bid no bhid
12 Gauge - Black S 6.00 no bid no bid
Width no provided - -
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STEEL CULVERT PIPE

SEX MONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS
July 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025

Rail RoadYardi Thickness | iGatewaySteel

Thickness Sunbelt Thickness

16" - NEW $  44.20 25+ no bhid - no bhid -
16" - USED S 26.65 25+ 5 30.00 0.25 no bid

18" - NEW no bid -- no bid - no hid -
18"~ USED S 37.70 25+ no hid - $36.50 0.25
20" - NEW S 65.00 25+ no bid -- no hid

20" - USED S 31.23 25+ S 38.00 0.375 533.70 0.25
22" - NEW no bid - no bid - no bid -
22" - USED 5 39.00 25+ no hid - $33.90 -
24" - NEW S 80.60 25+ no bid - no bid --
24" - USED S 4160 254+ S 43,00 0.312 $46.00 0.25
30" - NEW S 93.60 25+ no bid - no bid --
30" - USED $ 5293 .25+ S 58.00 0.375 $59.00 0.312
37" - NEW S 115.70 -- no hid - no bid -
37" - USED S  60.75 25+ ) 64.00 1 36"x.375 no hid -~
41" - NEW no bid - no bid -~ no bid -
41" - USED S 8220 25+ no bid -- no bid --
48" - NEW S 165.20 25+ no bid - no bid -
48" - USED S 129.28 25+ no bid - ho bid -
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SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS
July 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025

FULL CIRCLE STEEL PIPE CULVERT (2 2/3" x 1/2")

DUB ROSS | Galvanized | Aluminized DUB ROSS | Galvanized |Aluminized
12" - 16 Gauge S 1268} 5S 14.33 54" - 16 Gauge S 64.00 $72.32
12" - 14 Gauge $ 1525|5§ 15.25 54" - 14 Gauge | S 69.88| $78.96
12" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid 54" -12 Gauge [ S 97.34| $109.99
12" - 10 Gauge no bhid no bid 54" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
15" - 16 Gauge S 15675 1771 60" - 16 Gauge | S 70.99] $80.22
15" - 14 Gauge $ 19625 2217 60" - 14 Gauge | S 88,99 | $100.56
15" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid 60" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid
15" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid 60" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
18" - 16 Gauge S 187115 21.14 66" -16 Gauge | S 77.98 | $88.11
18" - 14 Gauge S 235015 26.56 66" - 14 Gauge S  97.74 | $110.45
18" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid 66" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid
18" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

72" - 16 Gauge S 84.97| 596.00
24" - 16 Gauge S 247815S 28.00 72" -14 Gauge | $ 106.50 | $120.35
24" - 14 Gauge $ 3119|S 3524 72" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid
24" - 12 Gauge § 45305 5119 72" - 10 Gauge no bid no hid
24" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

78" -16 Gauge { S 91.94 | $103.89
30" - 16 Gauge S 308415 34.85 78"-14 Gauge | S 90.44 | $102.20
30" - 14 Gauge $ 38605 43.62 78" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid
30" - 12 Gauge S 54.06|S5 6108
30" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid 84" -16Gauge | $ 9893 | $111.79

84" - 14 Gauge | § 124.00| $138.89
36" - 16 Gauge § 36.92|S 4172 84" - 12 Gauge | S 179.25| §202.55
36" - 14 Gauge S 46.301S 5232 84" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
36" - 12 Gauge S 647715 73.19
36" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid 90" -14 Gauge | § 132.76 | $148.70

96" - 14 Gauge | $ 14150 | $159.92
42" - 16 Gauge § 42685 48.23 102" - 14 Gauge | S 150.28 | $168.31
42" - 14 Gauge $ 53.18}56S 60.09 108" -12 Gauge | $ 226.77 | $256.25
42" - 12 Gauge S 75.2318S 85.00 114" - 12 Gauge | S 241.27 | $278.50
42" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid 120" -12 Gauge | $ 260.00 | $299.48
48" - 16 Gauge § 57.02|8 6443
48" - 14 Gauge S 6154(S 6954
48" - 12 Gauge S 86868 9815
48" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
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SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS
July 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025

METAL PIPE ARCHED CORRIGATED CULVERT

Galvanized I Aluminized

DUB ROSS DUB ROSS I Galvanized l Aluminized

17" x 13" - 16 Gauge | S 166718 18.71 71" x 47" - 16 Gauge no bid no hid

17" %x13"-14 Gauge | $  20.62 | S 23.17 71" x 47" - 14 Gauge S 93441 § 98.11

17" x 13" - 12 Gauge ne bid no bid 71" x 47" - 12 Gauge S 120.32 | & 138.37
71" x 47" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

21" x 15" - 16 Gauge | S 197118 22.14

21" x 15" - 14 Gauge | S 2450 | § 27.56 77" x 52" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid

21" x 15" - 12 Gauge no hid no bid 77" x 52" - 14 Gauge S 102671 S 11597
752" - 12 Gauge ne bid no bid

24" x 18" - 16 Gauge | S 2275 | S 25.57

24" x 18" - 14 Gauge | S 2834 | § 31.90 83" x 57" - 16 Gaupe no bid no hid

24" x 18" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid 83" x 57" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid

28" x 20" - 16 Gauge | S 25.78 1 S 29.00

28"x20"-14Gauge |S 32195  36.24

28" x 20" - 12 Gauge | § 46301 S 52.19

35" x 24" - 16 Gauge | § 3238 | S 36.59

35" x24"-14 Gauge | S 40535 4580

35" x 24" - 12 Gauge | $ 56.76 | § 64.13

42" x 29" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid

42" x29"-14 Gauge |S 486215 5494

A2"x29"-12Gauge | S 68.00|S  76.85

42" % 29" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

49" x 33" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid

49" % 33"-14 Gauge | S 5584 | § 63.09

49" x33"-12 Gauge | S 78991 S 89.25

49" x 33" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

47" x 38" - 16 Gauge no hid no bid

47" x 38" - 14 Gauge no bid no bid

47" x 38" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid

47" % 38" - 10 Gauge no hid no hid

57" x 38" - 16 Gauge no hid no hid

57" x 38" - 14 Gauge no bid no bid

57" x 38" -12 Gauge | $ 91206  103.06

57" x 38" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

64" x 43" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid

64" x 43" - 14 Gauge no bid no bid

64" x 43" - 12 Gauge { S 10221 |$ 11549

64" x 43" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
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SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS
July 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025

CORRUGATED METAL CULVERT PIPE - ARCHED

DUB ROSS

Galvanized l Aiu miﬂized

DUB ROSS 1 Galvanized I Aluminized
40" X 31" 16 Gauge no bid no bid 87" x 63" 16 Gauge no bid no bid
40" X 31" 14 Gauge nio bid no bid 87" x63" 14 Gauge | S 949715 107.31
40" X 31" 12 Gauge no hid no bhid 87" x63" 12 Gauge | § 176955 200.01
40" X 31" 10 Gauge no bid no bid 87" x 63" 10 Gauge no bid no bid
40" X 31" 8 Gauge no bid no bid 87" x 63" 8 Gauge no bid no bid
46" x 34" 16 Gauge no hid no bid 95" x 67" 16 Gauge no bid no hid
46" x 34" 14 Gauge S 646218 73.02 | 95" x 67" 14 Gauge no bid no bid
46" x 34" 12 Gauge S 949015 105.27 95" x 67" 12 Gauge | S 188.21 S 212.68
46" x 34" 10 Gauge no hid no bid 95" x 67" 10 Gauge no hid no bid
46" x 34" 8 Gauge no bid no bid 95" x 67" 8 Gauge no hid no bid
53" x 41" 16 Gauge ne bid no bid 103" x /1" 16 Gauge no hid no bid
53" x 41" 14 Gauge S 67.13 | § 75.27 103" x 71" 14 Gauge | call for quote | call for quote
53" x 41" 12 Gauge S 9490|S 105.27 103" x 71" 12 Gauge | call for quote | call for quote
53" x 41" 10 Gauge no bid no hid 103" x 71" 10 Gauge no hid no bid
53" x 41" B Gauge no bid no bid 103" x 71" 8 Gauge no bid no bid
60" x 46" 16 Gauge no bid no bid I'Call Dub Ross for quote on'specificjob =
60" x 46" 14 Gauge ) 7337 |8 82.91
60" x 46" 12 Gauge S 1022118  115.50
60" x 46" 10 Gauge no bid no bid
60" x 46" 8 Gauge no bid no bid
66" x 51" 16 Gauge no bid no bid
66" x 51" 14 Gauge S 9344;S$ 10559
66" x 51" 12 Gauge no bid no bid
66" x 51" 10 Gauge no bid no bid
66" x 51" 8 Gauge no bid no bid
73" x 55" 16 Gauge no bid no bid
73" x 55" 14 Gauge S 10263 |§ 11597
73" x 55" 12 Gauge no bid no bid
73" x 55" 10 Gauge no bid no bid
73" x 55" 8 Gauge no bid no bid
81" x 59" 16 Gauge no bid no hid
81" x 59" 14 Gauge $ 1118315 126.36
81" x 59" 12 Gauge no hid no bid
81" x 59" 10 Gauge no bid no hid
81" x 59" 8 Gauge no bid no bid
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SEX MIONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS
July 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025

CORRUGATED POLYETHELENE & POLYPROPYLENE CULVERT PIPE

DUB ROSS THE RAILROAD YARD STILLWATER
TYPE: Polyethelene Polypropylene Polyethelene Polypropylene
8" N 12 per ft S 7.90 no hid no provided no provided
Connector S 7.90 no hid no provided no provided
10" N 12 per ft S 11.45 no bid no provided no provided
Connector S 11.45 ne hid no provided no provided
12" N 12 per ft S 86815 97515 899§ 9,91
Connector ) 8681898 975§ 8991t 8 9.91
15" N 12 per ft S 123815 14.05 | $ 12.83 | S 14.21
Connector 5 12.38 | § 14.05 (8 12831 S 14.21
18" N 12 per ft ) 16.72 1S 1898 S 17.46 | § 19,18
Connector $ 16.72 | § 189815 17.46 1 S 19.18
24" N 12 per ft S 2647 | S 2875 | & 275616 29.01
Connector S 26475 28751 S 2756 | § 29.01
30" N 12 per ft S 35451 % 43,681 S 3667 |5 44.23
Connector § 3545 | S 43681 S 36.67 | S 44,23
36" N 12 perft S 5094 | S 572515 52.34 1§ 57.85
Connector S 101881 § 114.50 | § 104691 S 115.69
42" N 12 per ft $ 62.05| % 71.25 | $ 64.29 | $ 72.04
Connector S 124101 14250 | $ 128.58 | S 144.08
48" N 12 per ft S 89,701 S 97.68 | $ 93.17 | § 98.96
Connector ) 179401 § 195.36 | & 186.33 | 5 197.93
60" N 12 per ft S 12795 S 134.201 8 13233 § 135.95
Connector S 25590 | § 268.40 | S 264,66} S 271.90

*Rail Road Yard: $2900.00 minimum order or $150.00 drop fee applies
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SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS
July 1, 2025 to December 371, 2025

CENTURY PRODUCTS 1

TYPE: Polyethelene| Polypropylene
8" N 12 per ft S 3.98 no bid
Connector S 4,99 no bid

10" N 12 per ft S 5.13 no bid
Cannector S 6.86 no bid

12" N 12 per ft $ 698 |5 9.75
Connector S 93715 9.75
15" N 12 per ft S 923§ 14.05
Connector $ 2584 |8 14.05
18" N 12 perft S 13.21 ] § 18.98
Connector ) 4339 | S 18.98
24" N 12 per ft S 21071 S8 28.75
Connector S 5494 | 5 28.75
30" N 12 per ft $ 3314 | S 43,68
Connector S 4447 1 S 43.68
36" N 12 per ft S 11433 (S 57.25
Connector 5 60411 S 114.50
42" N 12 per ft S 1473115 71.25
Connector 5 74.86 | S 142.50
48" N 12 per ft § 175891 S 97.68
Connector S 179401 S 195.36
60" N 12 perft NO BID NO BID
Connector NO BID NO BiIb

minium order $3,000 or 5150 drop fee applys
Coupler = 1 ft of pipe {up to 3G in)
Coupler = 2ft of pipe{ 36 in, 42in, 48 in 60 in
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