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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
January 1, 2026 to June 30, 2026

ASPHALT - Hot Mix Lay Concrete - Type A

Per Ton - Delivered
Per Ton - Delivered & Laid
Per Ton - Pick Up

ASPHALT - Hot Mix Lay Concrete - Type B

Per Ton - Delivered
Per Ton - Delivered & Laid
Per Ton - Pick Up

ASPHALT - Hot Mix Lay Concrete - Type C

I

Per Ton - Delivered
Per Ton - Delivered & Laid
Per Ton - Pick Up

MILLINGS

Asphalt Millings
Crushed Millings
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
January 1, 2026 to June 30, 2026

PROLINE POLYMER MOD COLD ASPHALT

FOB Plant S 120.00

Delivered S 152.00

Delivered & Laid -

Minimum 25 tons

. loganCoAsphalt ] i

35# Bags - Delivered no bid

35# Bags - Delivered & Laid no bid

35# - FOB Plant no bid

Minimun no bid

~Logan Co Asphalt: |

50# Bags - Delivered S 13.00

50# Bags - Delivered & Laid no bid

504 Bags - FOB Plant S 11.50

Minimum If Delivered - 50 bags

MASTIC CRACK SEALANT

Togan CO_:'AS'_'pha:it

Per lb. no bid

FLY ASH - OILS

Per gallon Sl e e

AC7.5

AC 20

MC 30

MC 70

MC 800

MC 3000

$5-1 Tack Qil
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EMULSION PRODUCTS

Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
January 1, 2026 to June 30, 2026

Per Gallon

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions

Wright Asphalt |

Plant Location:
5850 ARKANSAS RD CATOOSA OK 5 Sulzer Way

74015-3045 Tulsa OK 74131
SS-1 PICKUP S 2.40 no bid
SS-1 DELIVERED $ 2.45 no hid
CRS-2 PICKUP S 2.02 S 2.08
CRS-2 DELIVERED S 2.07 | S 2.10
CRS-2S PICKUP S 242 | S 2.37
CRS-2S DELIVERED S 247 | S 2.39
CRS-2+ PICKUP S 225 |8 227
CRS-2+ DELIVERED S 230 1|S 2.29
AE-P PICKUP S 2.60 no bid
AE-P DELIVERED S 2.65 no bid
CQS-1F PICKUP no bid S 2.38

no bid
CQS-1F DELIVERED S 2.40
REJUVENATOR
Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions | Wright Asphalt |

CMS - 1PC SCRUB SEAL
SEALER APPLIED IN PLACE no bid no bid
MAXIMUM WAIT TIME no bid 1lhr @ plant
DEMURRAGE CHARGE: (2 HR FREE) perhr | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00
PUMP OFF CHARGE S 150.00 | S 150.00
SHORT FREIGHT —
LOAD MINUMUM - 48,000.lbs

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions- additonal feight added to loads less than 48,000 Ibs

Wright Asphalt Products Co- Plant Location 5 Salzer Way Tulsa OK 74131
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Six Month Materials Bid Tahulations
Janurary 1, 2026 to June 30, 2026

CONCRETE

PRODUCT

3000# P.S.1. 5 SACK

3500# P.S.1. 5 SACK

4000# P.S.1. 6 SACK

HIH EARLY 6.5 SACK

FREIGHT PER LOADED MILE

GRADER BLADES

Quoted price is per foot YELLOWHOUSE MACHINERY
Unit Price Total
1/2" x 6" per foot no bid no bid
1/2" x 8" per foot no bid no bid
5/8" x 6" per foot S 14.02 | $ 98.00
5/8" x 8" per foot S 1741 ] S 121.00
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
January 1, 2026 to June 30, 2026

ROCK
Western Aggregates LLC | Burbank Materials LLC [ Cornerstone Crushing (Blue Pool)
FOB PLANT PER TON FOBQuarry [  Perton FOB PLANT PER TON
8251 W RENO OKC 73127 Burbank 11995 W Canteen Rd
11/2" Crusher Run S 12.50 S 1240 | $ 10.00
3/4" Crusher Run S 13.20 S 1290 | $ 10.00
Screenings S 12.30 S 11.00 | $ 9,00
3/8" Chips S 36.00 NB
1/2" Chips S 24,00 NB
5/8" Chips S 38.00 NB
1 1/2" Road Rock S 12.40 S 15.50 | § 12.00
3/4" Class A NO BID NB
12" Rip Rap 3 31.00 NB 3 22.00
18" Rip Rap S 31.00 s 35.50 | $ 24,00
TBSC Type A NB
3/4" TBSC NB
Bedding Rock NB S 14.00
Crushed Concrete NB
Screenings-Asphalt NB
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
January 1, 2026 to June 30, 2026

BRIDGE NAILS

Sunbelt
40 D Common, Per 100# no bid
60 D Common, Per 100# no bid
80 D Common, Per 100# no hid
40 D Ring Shank, Per 100# no bid
60 D Ring Shank, Per 100# no bid
CLIPS

Sunbelt
Steel "I" Beam Bridge Clips-Lg - each no bid
Steel "I" Beam Bridge Clips-Sm - each no bid
BEAMS

] Sunbelt

HP 8 x 36 # Beams - NEW (no welds, rust free) S 0.7980
Length 30'-'50
HP 10 x 42" Beams-NEW (no welds, rust free) S 0.7980
Length 30' - 40'
STRUCTURAL STEEL-NEW

Sunbelt
Per # S 0.83
Length *
STRUCTURAL STEEL-USED

Sunbelt
Per # no bid
Length S 0.44
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
January 1, 2026 to June 30, 2026

REBAR
S | sSunbeltis sy
1/2"- per ft. - rust free S 0.418
Length: Standard 20
1/2"- per ft. - rust free no hid
Length: Non Standard - (foot) no bid
5/8" - per ft. - rust free $ 0.6500
Length: Standard - (foot) 20
5/8" - per ft. - rust free no bid
Length: Non Standard - {foot) no bid
GUARDRAILS
] Sl | “ Sunbelt: | - Advanced WorkZone -
NEW - per ft. 5 8.59 40.00 INSTALLED
USED - per ft. S 4.25 5.00 sale price
ENDWINGS
cicien o D ginbelp
NEW - per ft. S 64.90
USED - per ft. no bid
CHAIRS
L 5 S Sunbelt
Continous - each S 6.20
Single - Each S 6.80
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SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID
January 1, 2026 to June 30, 2026

BRIDGE PLANKS NGO il

GALVANIZED 6 X 2, PER SQ FT

7 GUAGE

10 GUAGE

12 GUAGE

GALVANIZED 9X3 PER 5Q FT

3 GUAGE

5 GUAGE

7 GUAGE

GALVANIZED 12X4 1/4PER SQ FT

7 GUAGE

BLACK 6X2 PER SQ FT

7 GUAGE

10 GUAGE

12 GUAGE

BLACK 12X4 1/4 PER SQ FT

7 GUAGE
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
January 1, 2026 to June 30, 2026

PIPE PILING

SRR I 2| SunbeltEquipment. -
7'5/8 X 394, 1/2" wall, per foot no bid
9'5/8 X 474, 1/2" wall, per foot no bid
HEAVY WALL PILING

T T T vt
6" - NEW - per ft 562 26.00
7" - NEW - per ft no bid
8" - NEW- per ft no hid
9" - NEW - per ft no bid
10" - NEW-per ft 3753290
12" - NEW - per ft no bid
6" - USED - per fL no bid
7" - USED - per ft : no bid
8"-USED - per ft no hid
9" - USED per ft no bid
10" - USED - per ft no bid
12" - USED - per ft no bid
INTERLOCKING SHEET PILING

I | | 2 Sunbelt Equnpment L

7 Gauge - Aluminized no bid
7 Gauge - Galvanized no bid
7 Gauge - Black no bid
10 Gauge - Aluminized no bid
10 Gauge - Galvanized ) 8.69
10 Gauge - Black s 7.90
12 Gauge -Aluminized no bid
12 Gauge - Galvanized no bid
12 Gauge - Black no bid
LUMBER
Doulas Fir-Pressure Treasted
Creosote - per MBF
3"x12"-8"to 24"
4" x 12" - 16" to 24"

BONDED FABRIC Lo i
QTY  UNIT DESCRIPTION IUNI'E' PRICE TOTAL
600 SQYD  BONDED FABRIC
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STEEL CULVERT PIPE

Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
January 1, 2026 to June 30, 2026

Sunbelt Equipment Thickness
16" - NEW no bid --
16" - USED no bid --
18" - NEW no bid --
18"- USED S 25.95 1/4
20" - NEW no bid --
20" - USED S 37.70 1/4
22" - NEW no bid -
22" - USED no bhid --
24" - NEW no bid --
24" - USED S 41.90 1/4
30" - NEW no bid -
30" - USED S 69.00 5/16
37" - NEW no bid --
37" - USED no bid --
41" - NEW no bhid --
41" - USED no bid --
48" - NEW no bid --
48" - USED S 130.00 3/8
9'-10' TANK CARS - NEW
9'-10' TANK CARS - USED
1/2 TANKS - NEW
1/2 TANKS - USED
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
January 1, 2026 to June 30, 2026

FULL CIRCLE STEEL PiPE CULVERT (2 2/3" X 1/2")

DUBROSS - | Galvanized | Aluminized | PUBROSS | Gawvanized | Aluminized -
12"-16 Gauge S 12.65 $ 14.33 48" -16 Gauge | S 57.23| S  64.66
12" - 14 Gauge S 1525158 17.23 48" -14 Gauge | S 6197 | S 70.03
12" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid 48" -12 Gauge | S 8777 |5 9830
12" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid 48" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
15" - 16 Gauge S 1568 | 5 17.72 54"-16 Gauge |$ 64.15]S 71.85
15" - 14 Gauge S 196918 2225 54" -14Gauge | $ 6964 |5 7870
15" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid 54" -12 Gauge | S 98365 111.15
15" - 10 Gauge no bid no hid 54" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
18" - 16 Gauge S 187218 2115 60"-16 Gauge {5 71.24| S B80.50
18" - 14 Gauge S 2371 S 2680 60" -14 Gauge | S 8961 |S$ 101.26
18" - 12 Gauge no bid no hid 60" - 12 Gauge | $110.78 [ S 124.08
18" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid 60" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
21" - 16 Gauge S 21811 S 24.65 66" -16 Gauge | § 78,52 88.73
21" - 14 Gauge S 2748 1S 31.05 66" -14 Gauge | $ 99.10 111.98
21" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid 66" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid
21" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
72"-16Gauge | S 86.14 97.34
24" - 16 Gauge S 2486 | S 28.09 72" - 14 Gauge | $107.61 121.60
24" - 14 Gauge ) 31.41| & 3550 72" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid
24" - 12 Gauge 5 46.15| 5 52.15 72" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
24" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
78" -16Gauge | $ 9290 104.97
27" - 16 Gauge no bid no hid 78" -14 Gauge | $116.85 131.47
27" - 14 Gauge no bid no bid 78" - 12 Gauge no bhid no bid
27" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid
27" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid 84" -16 Gauge | $ 99.62 1 11256
84" - 14 Gauge $125.30 141.60
30" - 16 Gauge $ 3090 $ 34.97 84" - 12 Gauge | $178.64 201.87
30" - 14 Gauge ) 38081 S 44.04 84" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
30" - 12 Gauge s 552015 6237
30" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
36" - 16 Gauge S 3692 | S 4172
36" - 14 Gauge S 4647 | 5 52.51
36" - 12 Gauge 5 65681 s 7422
36" - 10 Gauge S 65.681 S 74.22
42" - 16 Gauge ] 4327 1S 48.90
42" - 14 Gauge 5 5449 S 61.57
42" - 12 Gauge 5 7656 | §  86.51
42" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
January 1, 2026 to June 30, 2026

METAL PIPE ARCHED CORRIGATED CULVERT

DUBROSS o+ i IGalvamzed I . Aluminized DUBROSS . - i Galvanized | Aluminized -
17" x13"-16Gauge | § 16468 18.60 77" x 52" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid
17" x 13" -14 Gauge | S 2077 | 8 23.27 77" x 52" - 14 Gauge S 106.27 | & 120.08
17" x 13" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid 77" x 52" - 12 Gauge no hid no bid
21"x 15" -16 Gauge | S 19.84| S 22.22 83" x 57" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid
21" x 15" - 14 Gauge | § 24.90 | § 28.00 83" x 57" - 12 Gauge S 186,18 | & 198.97
21" x 15" - 12 Gauge no hid no bid

24" x 18" - 16 Gauge | S 2312 | § 25.89

24" x 18" -14 Gauge | S 2899 | § 32.61

24" x 18" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid

28" x 20" -16 Gauge | S 26.10 | § 29.49

28" x20"-14 Gauge | S 3288 (S 37.10

28" x20"-12 Gauge | S 48.87 | S 55.22

35" x 24" - 16 Gauge | S 32751 8 36.68

35" x 24" -14 Gauge | § 41515 46.91

35" x24"-12 Gauge | S 59.06 | § 66.45

42" x 29" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid

42" x 29" - 14 Gauge | S 49.26 | § 55.17

42" x 29" - 12 Gauge | S 69.95 | § 79.04

42" x 29" - 10 Gauge no bid no hid

49" x 33" - 16 Gauge no hid no bid

49" x 33" - 14 Gauge | $ 57751 S 64.69

49" x33"-12 Gauge | S 8039 S 50.84

49" x 33" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

57" x 38" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid

57" x 38" -14 Gauge | § 76.63 | S 86.60

57" x38"-12 Gauge |5 9216 (S 10414

57" x 38" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

64" x 43" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid

64" x 43" - 14 Gauge | S 87.04 | S 97.49

64" x 43" - 12 Gauge | S 103.28|S 11567

64" x 43" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

71" x 47" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid

71" x 47" - 14 Gauge | § 894,741 § 106.58

71"x47"-12 Gauge | S 116.321$ 131.44

71" x 47" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
January 1, 2026 to June 30, 2026

CORRUGATED METAL CULVERT PIPE - ARCHED

DUB ROSS . Gafvamzed ::Aiurﬁiréi?'é'd'ﬂ : DUBROSS | .::?.Ga_hié'ri'izéd' I Aiummlzed
40" X 31" 16 Gauge S 6097 (S 72.00 | [87"x 63" 16 Gauge no bid no bid
40" X 31" 14 Gauge S 71.74 | S 80.35 87" x 63" 14 Gauge | 5 9997 | §$ 1i12.31
40" X 31" 12 Gauge no bid no bid 87"x 63" 12 Gauge | S 176955 200.01
40" X 31" 10 Gauge no bid no bid 87" x 63" 10 Gauge no bid no bid
40" X 31" 8 Gauge no bid no hid 87" x 63" 8 Gauge no bid no bid
46" x 34" 16 Gauge no bid no bid 95" x 67" 16 Gauge no bid no bid
46" x 34" 14 Gauge S 8277 |S 93.52 95" x 67" 14 Gauge no bid no bid
46" x 34" 12 Gauge 5 82771 $S 93.52 95"x 67" 12 Gauge |5 19270 [ S 217.75
46" x 34" 10 Gauge no hid no bid 95" x 67" 10 Gauge no bid no bid
46" x 34" 8 Gauge no bid no bid 95" x 67" 8 Gauge na hid no bid
53" x 41" 16 Gauge no bid no bid 103" x 71" 16 Gauge | call for quote | cali for quote
53" x 41" 14 Gauge S 76.63 | S 86.60 103" x 71" 14 Gauge | call for quote | call for quote
53" x 41" 12 Gauge S 95.20 | S 106.63 103" x 71" 12 Gauge | call for quote | call for quote
53" x 41" 10 Gauge no hid no bid 103" x 71" 10 Gauge | call for quote | call for quote
53" x 41" 8 Gauge no hid no bid 103" x 71" 8 Gauge | call for quote | call for quote
60" x 46" 16 Gauge no bid no bid Call Dub Ross for quote on specific job

60" x 46" 14 Gauge S 87.04 |8 97.49

60" x 46" 12 Gauge S 103.281S5 11567

60" x 46" 10 Gauge no bid no bid

60" x 46" 8 Gauge no bid no bid

66" x 51" 16 Gauge no bid no bid

66" x 51" 14 Gauge S 9474 | S  106.58

66" x 51" 12 Gauge S 11632 | S 131.44

66" x 51" 10 Gauge no hid no bid

66" x 51" 8 Gauge no bid no bid

73" x 55" 16 Gauge no bid no bid

73"x55" 14 Gauge | S 10627 |$  120.08

73" x 55" 12 Gauge no bid no bid

73" x 55" 10 Gauge no bid no bid

73" x 55" 8 Gauge no bid no bid

81" x 59" 16 Gauge no bid no bid

81" x 59" 14 Gauge $ 116.88 | S 132.07

81" x 59" 12 Gauge $ 18618 (S 198.97

81" x 59" 10 Gauge no bid no bid

81" x 59" 8 Gauge no bid no bid
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
January 1, 2026 to June 30, 2026

CORRUGATED POLY ETHELENE CULVERT PIPE

| DUB ROSS LDub Ross Gray | Century Products

TYPE:
Black ALL

8" N 12 PERFT S 7.72 | no bid S 3.98
Connector S 7.72 | no bid S 4.99
10" N 12 per ft S 11.56 | no bid S 5.13
Connector S 11.56 | no bid S 6.86
12" N 12 per ft S 8.15 S 899 |S 6.98
Connector S 81515 8.99 |5 9.37
15" N 12 per ft S 1164 | S 1290 | $ 9.23
Connector S 11.64 | $ 1290 | S 25.84
18" N 12 per ft S 15.86 | S 17.41|§ 13.21
Connector S 15.86 | S 17.41 | S 43.39
24" N 12 per ft S 26.28 | S 26.36 | S 21.07
Connector ) 3495 | S 26.36 | S 54.94
30" N 12 per ft S 3495 | S 40.20| S 33.14
Connector S 4739 | S 40.20| S 98.27
36" N 12 per ft S 94.18 | $ 5257 | S 44.47
Connector S 5824 | S 105.14 | § 114.33
42" N 12 per ft S 116.48 | $ 65.47 | S 60.41
Connector S 8438 | S 130.94 | § 147.31
48" N 12 per ft S 168.76 | S 89.96 | $ 74.86
Connector S 119.87 | $ 179.92 | S 175.89
60" N 12 per ft S 149.09 | $ 123.57 | NB
Connector S 23974 | S 247.14 | NB
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