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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
July 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023

 Dunham Evans & Assoc T & C Asphalt 
Per Ton - Delivered no bid 97.00$                   no bid
Per Ton -  Delivered & Laid no bid 103.00$                no bid
Per Ton - Pick Up 60.00$         87.00$                   no bid

or S3
ASPHALT - Hot Mix Lay Concrete - Type B 

 Dunham Evans & Assoc T & C Asphalt 
Per Ton - Delivered no bid 97.00$                   no bid
Per Ton -  Delivered & Laid no bid 103.00$                no bid
Per Ton - Pick Up 63.00$         87.00$                   no bid

ASPHALT - Hot Mix Lay Concrete - Type C 
 Dunham Evans & Assoc T & C Asphalt 

Per Ton - Delivered no bid 97.00$                   no bid
Per Ton -  Delivered & Laid no bid 103.00$                no bid
Per Ton - Pick Up 66.00$         87.00$                   no bid

MILLINGS
 Dunham Evans & Assoc T & C Asphalt

Asphalt Millings no bid no bid no bid
Crushed Millings no bid 15.00$                   no bid

ASPHALT - Hot Mix Lay Concrete - Type A 
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
July 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023

Per Ton Logan Co Asphalt T & C Asphalt Dunham
FOB Plant 124.50$                        130.00$                117.00$       
Delivered 157.00$                        -- --
Delivered & Laid -- -- --
Minimum -- -- --

Logan Co Asphalt T & C Asphalt Dunham
35# Bags - Delivered no bid no bid no bid
35# Bags - Delivered & Laid no bid no bid no bid
35#  - FOB Plant no bid no bid no bid
Minimun no bid no bid no bid

Logan Co Asphalt T & C Asphalt Dunham

50# Bags - Delivered 15.50$                          $13.00/60# Bag no bid
50# Bags - Delivered & Laid $40.00 - Min/50 bags -- --
50# Bags - FOB Plant 12.50$                          $11.50/60# Bag no bid
Minimum If Delivered - 50 bags 100 bags

MASTIC CRACK SEALANT
Logan Co Asphalt T & C Asphalt Dunham

Per lb. no bid no bid no bid

FLY ASH - OILS

Per gallon 
 Asphalt & Fuel Supply 

LLC 
 Evans & 

Assoc 
AC 7.5 no bid no bid no bid no bid
AC 20 no bid no bid no bid no bid
MC 30 3.77$                             4.85$                     4.95$           no bid
MC 70 3.57$                             4.75$                     4.85$           no bid
MC 800 3.40$                             4.09$                     4.19$           no bid
MC 3000 3.16$                             3.88$                     3.98$           no bid
SS-1 Tack Oil no bid no bid 2.95$           6.00$        

Not Provided FOB Clinton Delivered
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SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID
July 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023

Per Gallon Coastal Energy Evans & Assoc Vance Bros Wright Asphalt Ergon

 PO Box 218 Willow 
Springs MO 65793 

 PO Box 30                    
Ponca City                      
OK 74602  

 4908 N Bryant    
OKC, OK 73121  

 Plant Location:              
5 Sulzer Way 

Tulsa OK 74131 

 Plant Location:            
5850 Arkansas Rd                   
Catoosa, OK 74015 

SS-1 PICKUP no bid 6.00$                2.75$            no bid 2.47$  
SS-1 DELIVERED 2.49$              6.50$                2.86$            no bid 2.50$  

CRS-2 PICKUP no bid no bid 2.75$            no bid 2.20$  
CRS-2 DELIVERED 2.41$              no bid 2.86$            2.23$  2.23$  

CRS-2S PICKUP no bid no bid 3.05$            no bid 2.52$  
CRS-2S DELIVERED 2.63$              no bid 3.16$            2.51$  2.55$  

CRS-2+ PICKUP no bid no bid 2.90$            no bid 2.37$  
CRS-2+ DELIVERED 2.49$              no bid 3.01$            2.44$  2.40$  

AE-P PICKUP no bid no bid 2.85$            no bid 2.57$  
AE-P DELIVERED 2.49$              no bid 2.96$            no bid 2.60$  

CQS-1F PICKUP no bid no bid no bid no bid 2.42$  
CQS-1F DELIVERED 2.53$              no bid  no bid 2.55$  2.45$  

REJUVENATOR
Coastal Energy Evans & Assoc Vance Bros Wright Asphalt Ergon

CMS - 1PC SCRUB SEAL
SEALER APPLIED IN PLACE no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
MAXIMUM WAIT TIME no bid no bid N/A 24 hrs 24 hrs

DEMURRAGE CHARGE: (2 HR FREE) per hr 100.00$         no bid  $         70.00 75.00$                 75.00$  
PUMP OFF CHARGE 125.00$         no bid 75.00$          100.00$               100.00$  
SHORT FREIGHT 1,559.00$      no bid -- -- --
LOAD MINUMUM -- -- 5,500 gallons 5,500 gallons 5,700 gallons

EMULSION PRODUCTS
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
July 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023

PRODUCT

Unit Price Total Unit Price
3000# P.S.I. 5 SACK no bid -- 132.75$            
3500# P.S.I. 5 SACK no bid -- 132.75$            
4000# P.S.I. 6 SACK no bid -- 135.75$            

HIH EARLY 6.5 SACK no bid -- 151.00$            

 FREIGHT PER LOADED MILE

Quoted price / per ft

Carbon Heat Treated Unit Price

1/2" x 6" per foot 10.24$               no bid no bid

1/2" x 8" per foot 16.20$               no bid no bid

5/8" x 6" per foot 12.20$               no bid 17.15$                  

5/8" x 8" per foot 16.51$               no bid 21.50$                  

Quoted price is per foot

High Carbon DH2 Bolt Hole Size
1/2" x 6' x 6 per foot 7.42$                 9.17$                 5/8
1/2" x 6' x 7 per foot 7.25$                 9.10$                 5/8
1/2" x 6' x 8 per foot 7.32$                 9.05$                 5/8

1/2" x 8' x 6 per foot 10.28$               13.63$              5/8
1/2" x 8' x 7 per foot 10.16$               12.55$              5/8
1/2" x 8' x 8 per foot 10.06$               12.43$              5/8

5/8" x 6' x 6 per foot 9.03$                 11.75$              5/8
5/8" x 6' x 7 per foot 9.26$                 11.44$              5/8
5/8" x 6' x 8 per foot 9.08$                 11.22$              5/8

5/8" x 8' x 6 per foot 12.76$               15.69$              5/8
5/8" x 8' x 7 per foot 12.72$               15.64$              5/8

DUB ROSS CO INC

CONCRETE

GRADER BLADES

DOLESE BROS. CO.

ENID CONCRETE:  Freight  is $4.00 per mile outside Enid limits 

YELLOWHOUSE MACHINERY

ENID CONCRETE CO., INC

--
Class A (2009)

Class AA (2009)

Class AA + 1/2 Sack

$48.00 Fuel Surcharge

(7') $120.05

(7') $150.50

Total

Warren Cat

no bid

no bid
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
July 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023

EVANS & ASSOC
FOB FOB Pick up FOB  Per ton 

Enid SY 7 Mile Mine

1 1/2" Crusher Run no bid no bid 14.25$                  no bid no bid
3/4" Crusher Run no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Screenings no bid no bid no bid 9.00$                 no bid

3/8" Chips no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
1/2" Chips no bid no bid no bid 18.75$              no bid
5/8" Chips no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

1 1/2" Road Rock no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

3/4" Class A no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

12" Rip Rap no bid no bid no bid 25.00$              no bid
18" Rip Rap no bid no bid no bid 25.00$              no bid

TBSC Type A no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
3/4" TBSC no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Bedding Rock no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Crushed Concrete no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Screenings-Asphalt no bid no bid no bid no bid 30.00$                   

ROCK
DOLESE BROS. CO. Stewart Stone

Pawnee
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
July 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023

BRIDGE NAILS
Rail Road Yard Sunbelt

40 D Common, Per 100# no bid no bid
60 D Common, Per 100# no bid no bid
80 D Common, Per 100# no bid no bid

40 D Ring Shank, Per 100# no bid no bid
60 D Ring Shank, Per 100# no bid no bid

CLIPS
Rail Road Yard Sunbelt

Steel "I" Beam Bridge Clips-Lg - each no bid no bid
Steel "I" Beam Bridge Clips-Sm - each no bid no bid

BEAMS
Rail Road Yard Sunbelt

HP 8 x 36 # Beams - NEW (no welds, rust free) 0.960$               0.89$                      
Length any 30' - 40'

HP 10 x 42" Beams-NEW (no welds, rust free) 0.796$               0.809$                    
Length any 30' - 40' - 50'

STRUCTURAL STEEL-NEW
Rail Road Yard Sunbelt

Per # foot 0.8032$            0.89$                      
Length  Standard 20' *
* Sunbelt:  20' - 25' - 30' - 35' - 40' - 50'
* Sunbelt : (channel & angle 20')

STRUCTURAL STEEL-USED
Rail Road Yard Sunbelt

Per # foot 0.45$                 0.45$                      
Length any WF beams only
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
July 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023

REBAR
Rail Road Yard Sunbelt

1/2"- per ft. - rust free 0.42$                   0.39$                   
Length: Standard 20' 20'

1/2"- per ft. - rust free 0.42$                   0.65$                   
Length: Non Standard - (foot) 20' 20'

5/8" - per ft. - rust free 0.8763 no bid
Length: Standard - (foot) 20' --

5/8" - per ft. - rust free 0.65$                   no bid
Length: Non Standard - (foot) 20' --

GUARDRAILS
Rail Road Yard Sunbelt

NEW - per ft. 9.45$                   9.90$                   
USED - per ft. 4.95$                   4.75$                   

ENDWINGS
Rail Road Yard Sunbelt

NEW - per ft. 64.95$                 69.00$                
USED - per ft. 25.00$                 no bid

CHAIRS 
Rail Road Yard Sunbelt

Continous - each no bid 5.50$                   
Single - Each no bid 1.75$                   
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
July 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023

BRIDGE PLANKS

Rail Road Yard
GALVANIZED 6 X 2,  PER SQ FT
3 GUAGE 28.19$               
5 GUAGE 19.61$               
7 GUAGE 15.80$               

GALVANIZED 9X3 PER SQ FT
3 GUAGE 43.69$               
5 GUAGE 38.70$               
7 GUAGE 34.92$               

GALVANIZED 12X4 1/4PER SQ FT
7 GUAGE no bid

BLACK 6X2 PER SQ FT
7 GUAGE 22.06$               
10 GUAGE 17.16$               
12 GUAGE 13.80$               

BLACK 12X4 1/4 PER SQ FT
7 GUAGE no bid

SIX MONTH MATERIALS BID
July 1, 2022 to December 31, 2022
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
July 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023

PIPE PILING
Rail Road Yard Sunbelt Equipment

7' 5/8 X 39#, 1/2" wall, per foot 38.64$                                19.90$                          
9' 5/8 X 47#, 1/2" wall, per foot 62.10$                                35.50$                          

Rail Road Yard Sunbelt Equipment

6" - NEW - per ft no bid 21.50$                          
7" - NEW - per ft no bid no bid
8" - NEW- per ft no bid no bid
9" - NEW - per ft no bid no bid
10" - NEW-per ft 40.00$                                no bid
12" - NEW - per ft no bid no bid

6" - USED - per ft no bid no bid
7" - USED - per ft no bid 19.90$                          
8"-USED - per ft no bid 22.50$                          
9" - USED per ft no bid 34.50$                          
10" - USED - per ft  no bid 29.50$                          
12" - USED - per ft no bid no bid

INTERLOCKING SHEET PILING
Rail Road Yard Sunbelt Equipment

7 Gauge - Aluminized no bid no bid
7 Gauge - Galvanized 14.74$                                no bid
7 Gauge - Black 12.19$                                no bid
10 Gauge - Aluminized no bid no bid
10 Gauge - Galvanized 9.43$                                   10.80$                          
10 Gauge - Black 9.22$                                   7.95$                             
12 Gauge -Aluminized no bid no bid
12 Gauge - Galvanized 7.94$                                   no bid
12 Gauge - Black 7.24$                                   no bid
Width 21.625"

HEAVY WALL PILING
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
July 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023

STEEL CULVERT PIPE
Rail Road Yard Thickness Sunbelt Equipment Thickness

16" - NEW 54.60$             1/4 + no bid --
16" - USED 37.80$             1/4 + 37.50$                   1/4
18" - NEW no bid -- no bid --
18"- USED 51.30$             1/4 + no bid --
20" - NEW 65.00$             1/4 + no bid --
20" - USED 49.40$             1/4 + 42.90$                   1/4
22" - NEW no bid -- no bid --
22" - USED 45.90$             1/4 + no bid --
24" - NEW 80.60$             1/4 + no bid --
24" - USED 41.85$             1/4 + 45.00$                   1/4
30" - NEW 110.50$           1/4 + no bid --
30" - USED 53.82$             1/4 + no bid --
37" - NEW no bid -- no bid --
37" - USED 69.00$             5/16 + no bid --
41" - NEW no bid -- no bid --
41" - USED 83.49$             5/16 + no bid --
48" - NEW 141.75$           1/4 + no bid --
48" - USED no bid -- 159.00$                1/4
48" - USED no bid -- 195.00$                3/8
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
July 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023

DUB ROSS Galvanized Aluminized DUB ROSS Galvanized Aluminized

12" - 16 Gauge 13.08$         15.05$      48" - 16 Gauge 60.96$     70.10$       
12" - 14 Gauge no bid no bid 48" - 14 Gauge 64.11$     73.73$       
12" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid 48" - 12 Gauge 93.22$     107.20$     
12" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid 48" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

15" - 16 Gauge 16.32$         18.77$      54" - 16 Gauge 68.42$     78.68$       
15" - 14 Gauge 20.91$         24.04$      54" - 14 Gauge 73.97$     85.06$       
15" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid 54" - 12 Gauge 104.83$  120.55$     
15" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid 54" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

18" - 16 Gauge 19.48$         22.40$      60" - 16 Gauge 75.88$     87.26$       
18" - 14 Gauge 25.10$         28.87$      60" - 14 Gauge 95.79$     110.16$     
18" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid 60" - 12 Gauge 118.00$  135.70$     
18" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid 60" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

21" - 16 Gauge 22.93$         26.37$      66" - 16 Gauge 83.36$     95.86
21" - 14 Gauge 28.99$         33.39$      66" - 14 Gauge 101.82$  117.09
21" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid 66" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid
21" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

72" - 16 Gauge 90.83$     104.45
24" - 16 Gauge 26.06$         29.97$      72" - 14 Gauge 110.94$  127.58
24" - 14 Gauge 33.25$         38.24$      72" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid
24" - 12 Gauge 48.85$         56.18$      72" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
24" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

78" - 16 Gauge 95.12$     109.39
27" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid 78" - 14 Gauge 120.06$  138.07
27" - 14 Gauge no bid no bid 78" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid
27" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid
27" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid 84" - 16 Gauge 102.35$  117.70

84" - 14 Gauge 133.49$  153.50
30" - 16 Gauge 32.32$         37.17$      84" - 12 Gauge 182.91$  210.34
30" - 14 Gauge 40.32$         46.37$      84" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid
30" - 12 Gauge 58.63$         67.42$      
30" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

36" - 16 Gauge 38.44$         44.21$      
36" - 14 Gauge 48.24$         55.47$      
36" - 12 Gauge 68.42$         78.68$      
36" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

42" - 16 Gauge 45.64$         52.44$      
42" - 14 Gauge 56.18$         64.61$      
42" - 12 Gauge 81.06$         93.22$      
42" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

FULL CIRCLE STEEL PIPE CULVERT (2 2/3" x 1/2")
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
July 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023

DUB ROSS Galvanized Aluminized DUB ROSS Galvanized Aluminized

17" x 13" - 16 Gauge 17.46$        20.08$         77" x 52" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid
17" x 13" - 14 Gauge 22.37$        25.73$         77" x 52" - 14 Gauge 111.85$        128.63$       
17" x 13" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid 77" x 52" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid

21" x 15" - 16 Gauge 20.84$        23.94$         83" x 57" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid
21" x 15" - 14 Gauge 26.85$        30.87$         83" x 57" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid
21" x 15" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid

24" x 18" - 16 Gauge 24.55$        28.23$         
24" x 18" - 14 Gauge 31.00$        35.65$         
24" x 18" - 12 Gauge no bid no bid

28" x 20" - 16 Gauge 27.88$        32.06$         
28" x 20" - 14 Gauge 35.57$        40.91$         
28" x 20" - 12 Gauge 52.27$        60.11$         

35" x 24" - 16 Gauge 34.58$        39.77$         
35" x 24" - 14 Gauge 43.10$        49.57$         
35" x 24" - 12 Gauge 62.73$        72.14$         

42" x 29" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid
42" x 29" - 14 Gauge 52.87$        60.80$         
42" x 29" - 12 Gauge 73.21$        84.19$         
42" x 29" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

49" x 33" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid
49" x 33" - 14 Gauge 60.11$        69.12$         
49" x 33" - 12 Gauge 86.73$        99.74$         
49" x 33" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

57" x 38" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid
57" x 38" - 14 Gauge 82.34$        94.69$         
57" x 38" - 12 Gauge 99.70$        114.65$       
57" x 38" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

64" x 43" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid
64" x 43" - 14 Gauge 91.80$        105.57$       
64" x 43" - 12 Gauge 112.15$      128.97$       
64" x 43" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

71" x 47" - 16 Gauge no bid no bid
71" x 47" - 14 Gauge 101.83$      117.10$       
71" x 47" - 12 Gauge 126.26$      145.19$       
71" x 47" - 10 Gauge no bid no bid

METAL PIPE ARCHED CORRIGATED CULVERT
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Six Month Materials Bid Tabulations
July 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023

DUB ROSS Galvanized Aluminized DUB ROSS Galvanized Aluminized

40" X 31" 16 Gauge no bid no bid 87" x 63" 16 Gauge no bid no bid
40" X 31" 14 Gauge no bid no bid 87" x 63" 14 Gauge 128.46$      147.73$         
40" X 31" 12 Gauge no bid no bid 87" x 63" 12 Gauge no bid no bid
40" X 31" 10 Gauge no bid no bid 87" x 63" 10 Gauge no bid no bid
40" X 31" 8 Gauge no bid no bid 87" x 63" 8 Gauge no bid no bid

46" x 34" 16 Gauge no bid no bid 95" x 67" 16 Gauge no bid no bid
46" x 34" 14 Gauge no bid no bid 95" x 67" 14 Gauge no bid no bid
46" x 34" 12 Gauge no bid no bid 95" x 67" 12 Gauge 195.75$      225.11$         
46" x 34" 10 Gauge no bid no bid 95" x 67" 10 Gauge no bid no bid
46" x 34" 8 Gauge no bid no bid 95" x 67" 8 Gauge no bid no bid

53" x 41" 16 Gauge no bid no bid 103" x 71" 16 Gauge call for quote call for quote

53" x 41" 14 Gauge 68.59$        78.88$         103" x 71" 14 Gauge call for quote call for quote

53" x 41" 12 Gauge 99.75$        114.71$       103" x 71" 12 Gauge call for quote call for quote

53" x 41" 10 Gauge no bid no bid 103" x 71" 10 Gauge call for quote call for quote

53" x 41" 8 Gauge no bid no bid 103" x 71" 8 Gauge call for quote call for quote

60" x 46" 16 Gauge no bid no bid
60" x 46" 14 Gauge 79.15$        91.02$         
60" x 46" 12 Gauge 112.17$      128.99$       
60" x 46" 10 Gauge no bid no bid
60" x 46" 8 Gauge no bid no bid

66" x 51" 16 Gauge no bid no bid
66" x 51" 14 Gauge 102.49$      117.87$       
66" x 51" 12 Gauge 126.26$      135.10$       
66" x 51" 10 Gauge no bid no bid
66" x 51" 8 Gauge no bid no bid

73" x 55" 16 Gauge no bid no bid
73" x 55" 14 Gauge 108.95$      125.29$       
73" x 55" 12 Gauge no bid no bid
73" x 55" 10 Gauge no bid no bid
73" x 55" 8 Gauge no bid no bid

81" x 59" 16 Gauge no bid no bid
81" x 59" 14 Gauge 118.71$      136.51$       
81" x 59" 12 Gauge no bid no bid
81" x 59" 10 Gauge no bid no bid
81" x 59" 8 Gauge no bid no bid

CORRUGATED METAL CULVERT PIPE - ARCHED

Call Dub Ross for quote on specific job
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6 Month Materials Bid
July 1, 2023 to December 31, 2023

TYPE: Polyethelene Polypropylene Polyethelene Polypropylene
M294 ASHTOO 330

8" N 12 per ft 7.22$                         no bid no bid no bid
Connector 7.22$                         no bid no bid no bid
10" N 12 per ft 10.50$                       no bid no bid no bid
Connector 10.50$                       no bid no bid no bid
12" N 12 per ft 9.24$                         9.40$                         8.98$                      9.26$                        
Connector 9.24$                         9.40$                         8.98$                      9.26$                        
15" N 12 per ft 13.10$                       13.46$                       12.83$                    13.22$                      
Connector 13.10$                       13.46$                       12.83$                    13.22$                      
18" N 12 per ft 17.74$                       18.34$                       17.45$                    17.99$                      
Connector 17.74$                       18.34$                       17.45$                    17.99$                      
24" N 12 per ft 28.03$                       28.93$                       27.55$                    28.38$                      
Connector 28.03$                       28.93$                       27.55$                    28.38$                      
30" N 12 per ft 36.95$                       38.30$                       36.66$                    37.75$                      
Connector 36.95$                       38.30$                       36.66$                    37.75$                      
36" N 12 per ft 48.62$                       50.38$                       48.22$                    49.66$                      
Connector 97.24$                       100.76$                    96.44$                    99.33$                      
42" N 12 per ft 58.23$                       61.89$                       58.28$                    61.01$                      
Connector 116.47$                    123.79$                    116.56$                 122.02$                    
48" N 12 per ft 85.70$                       89.68$                       85.82$                    87.94$                      
Connector 171.50$                    179.35$                    171.64$                 175.88$                    
60" N 12 per ft 121.83$                    127.75$                    121.91$                 125.58$                    
Connector 243.66$                    255.50$                    243.82$                 251.15$                    

CORRUGATED POLYETHELENE & POLYPROPYLENE CULVERT PIPE

Rail Road Yard: $2900.00 minimum order or $150.00 drop free

RAIL ROAD YARDDUB ROSS
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